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    01 - Exactly Like You  play   02 - I Like It Like That  03 - You Know You Know  04 - The
Dilemma  05 - AP Touro  06 - What Goes Around Comes Around  07 - Do It Again  08 - Why
Your Feet Hurt  play   09 - Shrimp and Gumbo  10 - Feelin' Free 
11 - Let's Go Get 'Em      Keith “Wolf”
Anderson, trombone;   Kenneth Austin, snare drum;   Keith “Bass Drum Shorty” Frazier, bass
drum, cymbal;   Philip Frazier, tuba, sousaphone;   John Gilbert, tenor saxophone, percussion;  
Gardner Ray Green, trumpet;   Kermit Ruffins, trumpet, vocals;   Derrick Shezbie, percussion,
trumpet;   Reggie Stewart, trombone;   Derek “Dirt” Wiley, percussion, trumpet.    

 

  

For the fourth week in a row, Rebirth of New Orleans is on the Billboard Jazz Charts, currently
at the #9 position. Also Rebirth is currently #1 on CMJ Jazz Chart! Thanks to everyone who
purchased the new record!  The Rebirth Brass Band is a New Orleans brass band. The group
was founded in 1982 by tuba/sousaphone player Philip Frazier, his brother, bass drummer,
Keith Frazier and trumpeter Kermit Ruffins, and other school marching band members from
Joseph S. Clark Senior High School in New Orleans’ Tremé neighborhood. The band was
discovered at the 1982 New Orleans Jazz & Heritage Festival and recorded its first studio
album in 1984.  Rebirth is known for combining traditional New Orleans brass band music,
including the New Orleans tradition of second line with funk, jazz, soul and hip hop influences.
In 1992, Ruffins and Rebirth split amicably after Ruffins decided not to accompany the band on
a trip to Africa.

  

Ruffins later formed his own Band, the Barbecue Swingers, who are signed to Basin Street
Records and play a more traditional style of New Orleans jazz music. Rebirth's longstanding
regular Tuesday night gig at the Maple Leaf Bar on Oak Street in the Carrollton neighborhood of
Uptown New Orleans is one of the pillars of the New Orleans music scene, and has served as a
reliable introduction to the city's nightlife for many newly arrived college students.  The band
regularly tours in North America and Europe, second only to the Dirty Dozen Brass Band in
popularity and acclaim among the brass bands of New Orleans.  For the fourth week in a row,
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